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Performance art ridesagain

T
NationalEndowmentfortheArts is back,

though this time without the taxpayers'
money funding exhibits of the celebrated

buUwhip of photographer Robert Mapplethorpe.
' ffow that the Bush regime is deftmct — which
stmgg^ed valiantly if not particularly successful-
]y\wth the quand^ ofwhether tokeep taxpayer
money out of the hungry grasp of peddlers of
pornographyparadingas artists—theenlightened
(lays of the Clinton era are here. And among the
things the Clintonians rectiiied was the runningof
the.NEA.

"Die four "performance artists" whose grants
Werecutofifunderthe Bushadministration (which
aw^edthem the grants in the firstplace)because
of controversies over their performances have
had theirgrants restored. "Bvoof the artists (we use
the- word loosely) also milked the taxpayer for
another $8,000 each on the grounds that their
rijgjitswere somehowviolated when they didntget
t£iQ publicfundstheirconsciences informedthem
they were entitled to get Each of the foin* also
scoffed up a cool six grand as well as damages for
invasion of privacy. How you can invade the pri
vacy of people who make &eir livingby perform-
i^. in the nude is a question well leave to the
lawyers to ejcplain.
. ^The four — who became known as the "NEA
Fbur,"justlikedissidents in Qiinaor something—
ai^e'nowtheheroes ofthe houramongthe artsyset,
apd last Sunday The New YorkTimes had a big
profile of them and of how terrific and sensitive
th^ are. The four are Karen Finley, John Fleck,
IJoUy Hughes and Tim Miller^ thi^ are homo
sexuals and all of them use homosexuality in the
performances thatyou now help payfor None of
them seems to have improved in the severalyears
sii^ aweary world lakhad to put up with them,
their "art" and their well-fimded and ever-louder
"cqnsciehces."
' .InaqplaimngtheaestheticsbehindMissFinley^
theatrical performance of smearing chocolate all
overhernude body, the Times, with its customary
patience foruslesserfolk who can'tbe expected
;^.understandthingslikeart,writesthatthechoco
late-body smearing was really a scene from Miss
Knley's " "We Keep Our VictimsReady,' in which

she applied chocolate cake frosting to her bare
torso as a symbol ofthe violation ofwomen's bod
ies." PresumablyMiss Finleywrote "We Keep Our
Victims Ready" all by herself, just like a grown
up dramatist Nevertheless, Eugene OTTeillshe's
not

Now, she complains, "I became a household
joke" becauseofthe publicity givenheract "Iwas
depictedas some ravinglunatic.... Hostmysense
of humor and felt enormous anxiety^' Poor, poor
Miss Finley. No doubtthe several thousand dollars
she and her lawyers have skimmed off the tax
payers will make her smile once more.

As for the others, eachofthem has a similartale
of woe. M:. Fleck, for instance, whined on the
OprahWinfreyShowthathe"wasmade to feel like
a disgusting pervert leeching on the taxpayers'
money. After that, I fiew home in a fetal position."
But not everything Mr. Fleck does is connected to
sex, homosexual or chocolate-frosted or whatev
er. One of his masterpieces is a skit called "All I
Know Is What I Read in the Newspapers," which
(aside from grossly exaggeratingthe degreeofMr.
Fleck's knowledge) consists entirely of what the
Times describes as "other people's quotes about
famous people, as they appeared in publications
from Thie Confessions to People magazine." What
genius!

Of course what is embarrassing about these
artists, more so than the obscenity orindecency of
their work, is that all of them are so profoundly,
amazingly and totally untalented. Thafs not their
fault, and they shouldn't be blamed for it Those
who should get the blame are the characters—in
the last administration and this one—who actu
ally gave them any money at all and those in the
media and the art world who are brazen enough
to claim that what these "artists" inflict upon the
public is worth doing for any reason, let alone
deservingof taxpayers' money and the encomiaof
the literati. Robert Mapplethorpe, whatever his
excesses with his famous bullwhip, was at least a
photographer of some ability, and it tells you a lot
about the state of the arts in this country that the
performance art of these four fraudulent medioc
rities makes you pine for the good old days when
Mr Mapplethorpe was still among us.


